
CAYMAN ISLANDS 
 

 
 

Supplement No.2 published with Gazette No. 20 dated 
2 October, 2006 

 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

THE TRUSTS (AMENDMENT) LAW, 2006 
 

(LAW 20 OF 2006) 



The Trusts (Amendment) Law, 2006 

 2



The Trusts (Amendment) Law, 2006 

 
CAYMAN ISLANDS 

 
Law 20 of 2006. 

 
I Assent 

 
 

Stuart Jack 
 

Governor. 
 

Date: 20 September,2006. 
 

 

A LAW TO AMEND THE TRUSTS LAW (2001 REVISION) IN ORDER 
TO INCREASE FEES; AND FOR INCIDENTAL AND CONNECTED 

PURPOSES 
 

ENACTED by the Legislature of the Cayman Islands. 
 

1. This Law may be cited as the Trusts (Amendment) Law, 2006. Short title 

2. The Trusts Law (2001 Revision), in this Law referred to as the “principal 
Law”, is amended in section 75 by deleting the words “four hundred dollars” and 
substituting the words “five hundred dollars”. 

Amendment of section 
75 of the Trusts Law 
(2001 Revision) – 
certificate and 
registration fee 

3. The principal Law is amended in section 78 by deleting the words “one 
hundred dollars” and substituting the words “five hundred dollars”. 

Amendment of section 
78 - annual fee 

 
Passed by the Legislative Assembly the 31st day of July, 2006. 

 
EDNA MOYLE 

 
Speaker. 

 
SHARON SMITH 

 
Acting Clerk of the Legislative Assembly. 

 3


