
CAYMAN ISLANDS 
 

 
 
     Supplement No. 5 published with Extraordinary  
     Gazette No. 14 dated 7 July, 2006.                                             
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

THE COMPANIES (AMENDMENT) LAW, 2006 
 

(LAW 13 OF 2006) 
 

 

 



The Companies (Amendment) Law, 2006 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 2



The Companies (Amendment) Law, 2006 

CAYMAN ISLANDS 

Law 13 of 2006. 
 

I Assent 
 

Stuart Jack 
 

Governor. 
 

           Date: 30 June, 2006 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 

A LAW TO AMEND THE COMPANIES LAW (2004 REVISION) TO 
INCREASE THE FEES FOR STRIKING COMPANIES OFF THE 

REGISTER; FOR FILING RESOLUTIONS, NOTICES, RETURNS AND 
OTHER DOCUMENTS; FOR ISSUING CERTIFICATES; FOR 

PROVIDING COPIES OF DOCUMENTS; FOR GENERAL SEARCHES; 
AND FOR INCIDENTAL AND CONNECTED PURPOSES 

ENACTED by the Legislature of the Cayman Islands. 

1. This Law may be cited as the Companies (Amendment) Law, 2006 and 
shall come into force on 1st July, 2006. 

Short title and 
commencement 

2. The Companies Law (2004 Revision), hereinafter called “the principal 
Law”, is amended in section 175 (2) by deleting the words “twenty dollars” and 
substituting the words “twenty-five dollars”. 

Amendment of section 
175- Company not 
operating may be struck 
off register               

3. The principal Law is amended in section 219 (1) - Amendment of section 
219 - fees in lieu of 
other provisions (a) in paragraph (a) by deleting “$ 25” and substituting “$30”; 

(b) in paragraph (b) by deleting “$41” and substituting “$82”; 
(c) in paragraph (c) by deleting “$41” and substituting “$82”; and 
(d) in paragraph (d) by deleting “$15” and substituting “$ 25”. 

 
 

 3



The Companies (Amendment) Law, 2006 

 
 
 

Passed by the Legislative Assembly the 1st day of June, 2006. 
 
 

EDNA MOYLE 
 

Speaker. 
 
 

WENDY LAUER EBANKS 
 

Clerk of the Legislative Assembly. 
 

 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 

 

 4


